UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT WESTERN DISTRICT OF ARKANSAS FAYETTEVILLE DIVISION

CURTIS J. NEELEY, JR.,	§	
Plaintiff,	§ 8	
Plaintill,	8 §	
V.	§ C	CIVIL ACT
	§	
5 FEDERAL COMMUNICATIONS	§	
COMMISSIONERS, ET AL.,	§	
	§	
Defendants.	§	

CIVIL ACTION NO. 5:14-CV-05135

DECLARATION OF JOSH THANE IN SUPPORT OF GOOGLE'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES AND EXPENSES

1. I am a partner of Haltom & Doan and am counsel for Defendant Google, Inc. in this action.

2. Google, Inc. retained Haltom & Doan and Durie Tangri LLC to defend it in this action.

3. Attached as Exhibit A are true and correct copies of the statements from Durie Tangri LLC and Haltom & Doan detailing the fees and expenses incurred by Google, Inc. in this matter from the date the complaint was filed in *Neeley v. 5 Federal Communications Commissioners, et al.*, Civil Action No. 5:14-cv-05135, until the August 5, 2014 order dismissing this action.

4. As detailed in Exhibit A, Google, Inc. has incurred a total of \$11,434.08 in reasonable attorneys' fees and expenses defending this matter.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the United States of America that the foregoing is true and correct. Executed on August 19, 2014.

/s/Joshua R. Thane Joshua R. Thane

DECLARATION OF J. THANE IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES – Page 1

Case 5:14-cv-05135-TLB Document 26-1 Filed 08/19/14 Page 2 of 14 PageID #: 304

Exhibit A



217 Leidesdorff Street San Francisco, CA 94111

TEL: 415-362-6666 FAX: 415-236-6300 Fed. Tax ID: 26-4153640

Attn: Google, Inc. 1600 Amphitheatre Parkway Mountain View, CA 94043 NEELEYStatement Date:06/01/2014Statement No.114798Account No.2.012Page No.1

RE: Neeley v. NameMedia, Inc., et al. 5:09-cv-05151-JLH 201000625

Professional Services through 05/31/2014

			Rate	<u>Hours</u>	
L120	A109	Review new complaint, memoranda to local counsel, Murray re: response.	680.00	0.50	340.00
L210	A108	Memorandum from Neeley re: service.	680.00	0.20	136.00
L210	A108	Memorandum from Neeley re: service, respond to same, memoranda to, from Murray re: same.	680.00	0.30	204.00
L120	A107	Memoranda to, from Neeley, client.	680.00	0.20	136.00
L120	A107	Memoranda to, from Thane re: status.	680.00	0.10	68.00
L120	A104	Review new order from court.	680.00	0.20	136.00
L120	A106	Review new motion, forward to client.	680.00	0.10	68.00
L210	A107	Memoranda to, from local counsel re: contempt hearing.	680.00	0.40	272.00
L470	A107	Review memorandum re: hearing; memoranda to, from co-counsel, client re: same. For Current Services Rendered	680.00	$\frac{0.40}{2.40}$	272.00 1,632.00
	L210 L210 L120 L120 L120 L120 L210	L210A108L210A108L120A107L120A107L120A104L120A106L210A107	L210A108Memorandum from Neeley re: service.L210A108Memorandum from Neeley re: service, respond to same, memoranda to, from Murray re: same.L120A107Memoranda to, from Neeley, client.L120A107Memoranda to, from Neeley, client.L120A107Memoranda to, from Thane re: status.L120A104Review new order from court.L120A106Review new motion, forward to client.L120A107Memoranda to, from local counsel re: contempt hearing.L470A107Review memorandum re: hearing; memoranda to, from co-counsel, client re: same.	L120A109Review new complaint, memoranda to local counsel, Murray re: response.680.00L210A108Memorandum from Neeley re: service.680.00L210A108Memorandum from Neeley re: service, respond to same, memoranda to, from Murray re: same.680.00L120A107Memoranda to, from Neeley, client.680.00L120A107Memoranda to, from Neeley, client.680.00L120A107Memoranda to, from Thane re: status.680.00L120A104Review new order from court.680.00L120A106Review new motion, forward to client.680.00L210A107Memoranda to, from local counsel re: contempt hearing.680.00L470A107Review memorandum re: hearing; memoranda to, from co-counsel, client re: same.680.00	L120A109Review new complaint, memoranda to local counsel, Murray re: response.680.000.50L210A108Memorandum from Neeley re: service.680.000.20L210A108Memorandum from Neeley re: service, respond to same, memoranda to, from Murray re: same.680.000.30L120A107Memorandu from Neeley, client.680.000.30L120A107Memoranda to, from Neeley, client.680.000.20L120A107Memoranda to, from Thane re: status.680.000.10L120A104Review new order from court.680.000.20L120A106Review new motion, forward to client.680.000.40L210A107Memoranda to, from local counsel re:

Google, InCase 5:14-cv-05135-TLB RE: Neeley v. NameMedia, Inc., et al. 5:09-cv-05151-JLH	Document 26-1	Filed 08/19/14	Page 4 of 14 Page D Statement I Statemen Accoun Page	t No. 114798 t No. 2.012
	Summa	ry of Fees		
<u>Timekeeper</u> Michael H. Page		<u>Hours</u> 2.40	<u>Rate</u> \$680.00	<u>Total</u> \$1,632.00
То	al Current Work			1,632.00
10.		-163.20		
Ba	lance Due			\$1,468.80
	Task Code Su	ummary of Fees		
			Professional Servic	Expenses
L120 Analysis/Strategy			748.00	0.00
L100 Case Assessment, Analysis and	Strategy		748.00	0.00
L210 Pleadings			612.00	0.00
L200 Pre-Trial Pleadings and Motions	3		612.00	0.00
L470 Enforcement			272.00	0.00
L400 Trial Preparation and Trial			272.00	0.00



217 Leidesdorff Street San Francisco, CA 94111

TEL: 415-362-6666 FAX: 415-236-6300 Fed. Tax ID: 26-4153640

Attn: Google, Inc. 1600 Amphitheatre Parkway Mountain View, CA 94043 NEELEYStatement Date:08/01/2014Statement No.115078Account No.2.012Page No.1

RE: Neeley v. NameMedia, Inc., et al. 5:09-cv-05151-JLH 201000625

Professional Services through 07/31/2014

					Rate	<u>Hours</u>	
07/23/2014 M		210 A104	Review additional pleadin	gs.	680.00	0.20	136.00
07/25/2014	4						
М	IHP L2	A106	Memoranda to, from Bare summary judgment motio		680.00	0.30	204.00
			For Current Services Re	ndered		0.50	340.00
			Summar	y of Fees			
	<u>keeper</u>			Hours	Rate		Total
IVIICNa	ael H. Paq	je		0.50	\$680.00		\$340.00
			Total Current Work				340.00
			10.00% discount per fee	agreement			-34.00
			Balance Due				\$306.00
			Task Code Su	mmary of Fees			
1.040	Disadira				Professional S		Expenses
	Pleading					40.00	0.00
L200	Pre-Trial	Pleadings and	Motions		3	40.00	0.00

Please make checks payable to Durie Tangri LLP

Case 5:14-cv-05135-TLB Document 26-1 Filed 08/19/14 Page 6 of 14 PageID #: 308

HALTOM & DOAN

TRIAL & APPELLATE COUNSEL

6500 Summerhill Road, Suite 100, Texarkana, Texas 75503 Mailing: Post Office Box 6227, Texarkana, Tx 75505-6227 ONE: (903) 255-1000

/	TELEPHONE: (903) 255-1000	I.D.# 35-2239600		LE: (903) 255-0800
	Google, Inc.	State	ment Date:	May 31, 2014
	Google, nic.	Stat	ement No.	24472
		A	ccount No.	25019.00004
			Page:	1

RE: Tort Case - Neeley v. Google, et al.

6

Services Rendered

				Hours	
05/07/2014 JRT	L460	A105	Communicate (in firm) - Correspondence with J. Doan and M. Page (co-counsel) regarding C. Neeley's		
			(plaintiff) latest complaint	0.20	75.56
JHD	L210	A104	Review/analyze - Review new complaint from C. Neeley with multiple non-sensical exhibits	0.50	330.57
JHD	L120	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) -		
			Correspondence with M. Page regarding strategy for having the Court dismiss sua sponte and enforcing the		
-			injunction and including Judge Hendren as a		
			defendant	0.30	198.34
05/09/2014					
JRT	L460	A108	Communicate (other external) - Correspondence from C. Neeley (plaintiff) regarding recent lawsuit	0.10	37.78
JHD	L120	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) -	0.10	57.75
			Correspondence with M. Page regarding Judge	0.20	132.23
JHD	L120	A108	Brooks' background and CV Communicate (other external) - Correspondence from	0.20	132.23
			C. Neeley regarding new lawsuit for malicious		
			dismissal and his new website "Theendofpornbywire.org"	0.20	132.23
			Theona of points y an old g	0.20	102.20
05/12/2014 JRT	L210	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) -		
JIXT	L2 10	AIU	Correspondence with C. Neeley (plaintiff) and M. Page		
10.7	1040		(co-counsel) regarding service of complaint	0.20	75.56
JRT	L210	A104	Review/analyze - Analyze new complaint in conjunction with C. Neeley's previous actions	0.40	151.11
JHD	L190	A108	Communicate (other external) - Correspondence from		
			C. Neeley regarding request to accept service; correspondence with M. Page regarding our declining		
			to accept service	0.20	132.23
05/13/2014					
) JRT	L210	A108	Communicate (other external) - Correspondence with		
\smile			C. Neeley (plaintiff) regarding service of complaint	0.10	37.78

,	Google	se 5:14- , inc.	cv-05135	TLB Document 26-1 Filed 08/19/14 Pag	e 7 of 14 PageID #: Account No: Statement No:	309 Fage: ∠ 05/31/2014 25019-00004 24472
\bigcirc	Tort C	ase - Neel	ey v. Googl	e, et al.		21472
	JHD	L190	A105	Communicate (in firm) - Correspondence with J.	Hours	
		1 4 2 0	4406	Thane regarding calling Judge Brooks' clerk and reporting back to the group	0.10	66.11
	JHD	L120	A106	Communicate (with client) - Correspondence with J. Thane regarding notification of service and Judge Brooks' strategy for handling the matter	0.20	132.23
	04.4					
05/14/20	JRT	L460	A108	Communicate (other external) - Telephone conferen with Judge Brooks' law clerk regarding dismissing complaint sue sponte	ce 0,40	151.11
	JRT	L460	A105	Communicate (in firm) - Correspondence with J. Doan, M. Page (co-counsel) regarding telephone conference with clerk; conference		151.11
	JHD	L120	A105	with J. Doan Communicate (in firm) - Conference with J. Thane	0.20	75.56
				regarding swift dismissal	0.10	66.11
05/17/20				.		
\bigcirc	JHD	L120	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Multiple correspondence from C. Hawkins with the Departme of Justice regarding C. Neeley's new lawsuit and the		
	JHD	L120	A104	upcoming hearing set by Judge Brooks Review/analyze - Review Judge Brooks' order to sho cause issued against C. Neeley	0.30 ow 0.10	198.34 66.11
					0.10	00.11
05/19/20						
	JRT	L210	A108	Communicate (other external) - Correspondence fro the Court regarding show cause hearing	0.20	75.56
	JRT	L210	A106	Communicate (with client) - Correspondence with M. Page and J. Doan regarding C. Neeley's show cause hearing	0.20	75.56
	JHD	L120	A105	Communicate (in firm) - Correspondence with J. Thane regarding Judge Brooks' law clerk's reaction of		10.00
	JHD	L120	A106	the Order to Show Cause Communicate (with client) - Multiple correspondence		132.23
				with M. Page and J. Thane regarding Ord to Show Cause, entry of appearance and strategy	ler 0.30	198.34
05/20/20	014					
	JRT	L210	A103	Draft/revise - Revise notice of appearance and filing same	0.20	75.56
	MGT	L120	A103	Draft/revise - Draft and prepare notice of appearance for J. Doan and J. Thane	0.70	96.67
$\epsilon \sim 10^{-10}$	JHD	L120	A104	Review/analyze - Review Judge Brooks' order denying leave for C. Neeley to file electronically	ng 0.10	66.11
0)0	014					
06_/120	JRT	L210	A104	Review/analyze - Review order denying C. Neeley's (plaintiff) request for electronic filing permissions	0.10	37.78

£	, <mark>Cas</mark> Google	6 <mark>6 5:14-0</mark> , Inc.	cv-05135-	TLB Document 26-1 Filed 08/19/14 Page	e 8 of 14 PageID #: Account No: Statement No:	310, Page: 3 05/31/2014 25019-00004 24472
	Tort Ca	ise - Neel	ey v. Google	e, et al.	Statement No.	24472
\bigcirc						
					Hours	
05/22/20	014					
	JHD	L120	A106	Communicate (with client) - Correspondence to M. Page regarding C. Neeley's motion to receive electronic notification and Judge Brooks' denial of same	0.10	66.11
	JHD	L120	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Correspondence with M. Page regarding attendance at the show cause hearing and ordering the transcrip		132.23
05/23/20	N14					
00/20/20	JRT	L210	A104	Review/analyze - Review C. Neeley's response to show cause order and correspondence with M. Page (co-counsel) regarding sam		113.33
	MGT	L120	A104	Review/analyze - Review Neeley's response to order		
	JHD	L210	A104	to show cause and prepare working set for J. Doan Review/analyze - Review C. Neeley's response to order to show cause and brief in support	0.20 0.20	27.62 132.23
	JHD	L210	A107	Communicate (other outside counsel) - Correspondence with C. Hawkins regarding J. Thane attendance at the hearing and inquiries for the		102.20
\bigcirc	JHD	L230	A107	Department of Justice Communicate (other outside counsel) - Correspondence with M. Page, J. Thane and	0.20	132.23
	JRT	L110	A104	regarding upcoming hearing Review/analyze - Review and outline history of multiple cases against Google for show cause hearin	0.10 Ig 4.00	66.11 1,511.12
	JRT	L440	A101	Plan and prepare for hearing	1.25	472.23
05/27/20	N14					
00/2//2	JRT	L230	A109	Appear for/attend - Attendance at show cause hearin in Fayetteville, Arkansas	3.50	1,322.23
	MGT	L120	A102	Research - Research law clerks for Judge Brooks ar send list to J. Thane	id 0.10	13.81
	JHD	L120	A105	Communicate (in firm) - Conference with J. Thane regarding hearing before Judge Brooks	0.40	264.45
	JHD	L120 L120	A104 A106	Review/analyze - Review Judge Brooks' minute entry Communicate (with client) - Multiple correspondence with M. Page regarding the hearing		66.11
	JHD	L120	A108	before Judge Brooks Communicate (other external) - Correspondence from C. Neeley regarding the show cause hearing and his		132.23
	JRT	L120	A106	pledge to never pursue Google in Court again Communicate (with client) - Correspondence to M. Page and J. Doan regarding recap of	0.10	66.11
()	JRŤ	L120	A108	hearing Communicate (other external) - Conference with J.	0.50	188.89
\bigcirc	•			Brooks' clerk regarding order	0.40	151.11
				Courtesy Discount		-767.49
				For Current Services Rendered	17.65	6,907.43

Google, Inc. 14-cv-05135-TLB		Page 9 of 14 PageID # Account No: Statement No:	E 311 _{05/31/2014} 25019-00004 24472
<u>Timekeeper</u> Jennifer Haltom Doan, Partner Jennifer Haltom Doan, Partner Jennifer Haltom Doan, Partner Jennifer Haltom Doan, Partner Michael Thornberry, Paralegal Joshua R. Thane, Associate Joshua R. Thane, Associate Joshua R. Thane, Associate	Services Rendered Summary <u>Hours</u> 0.80 1.30 0.50 1.80 1.00 0.30 10.45 1.50	<u>Rate</u> \$661.10 661.13 661.14 661.15 138.10 377.77 377.78 377.80	<u>Total</u> \$528.88 859.47 330.57 1,190.07 138.10 113.33 3,947.80 566.70
05/20/2014 L190 E101 Pho	<u>Expenses</u> g distance telephone charges, to Fayettev, tocopy charges, 7 pages al Expenses	AR	1.75 <u>0.70</u> 2.45
0 2014 L190 E112 Cou 0	Advances art fees - document fee - pleadings art fees - document fee - pleadings -of-town travel - Travel to/from Fayetteville, se hearing (J. Thane) al Advances	AR for show	0.30 0.30 0.20 0.40 3.00 1.70 0.50 <u>268.80</u> <u>275.20</u>
	al Current Work		7,185.08
Pre	vious Balance		\$10,260.05
0-30 31-60 7,185.08 0.00 L110 Fact Investigation/Development		0.00	<u>\$17,445.13</u> <u>181+</u> 2,746.81 <u>Expenses</u> 0.00

		Services Rendered	Exheiizea
L110	Fact Investigation/Development	1 511. 12	0.00
L120	Analysis/Strategy	2527.61	0.00
L()	Other Case Assessment, Development and Administration	198.34	277.65
L100	Case Assessment, Development and Administration	4,237.07	277.65
L210	Pleadings	1237.27	0.00
L230	Court Mandated Conferences	1388.34	0.00

• •	* Case 5:14-cv-05135-TLB Google, Inc.	Document 26-1	Filed 08/19/14	Page 10 of 14 PageID #	: 312 Page: 5 05/31/2014
				Account No:	25019-00004
				Statement No:	24472
	Tort Case - Neeley v. Google, et a	1.			
\sim					

		Services Rendered	Expenses
L200	Pre-Trial Pleadings and Motions	2,625.61	0.00
L440	Other Trial Preparation and Support	472.23	0.00
L460	Post-Trial Motions and Submissions	340.01	0.00
L400	Trial Preparation and Trial	812.24	0.00

Case 5:14-cv-05135-TLB Document 26-1 Filed 08/19/14 Page 11 of 14 PageID #: 313

HALTOM & DOAN

TRIAL & APPELLATE COUNSEL

6500 Summerhill Road, Suite 100, Texarkana, Texas 75503 Mailing: Post Office Box 6227, Texarkana, Tx 75505-6227

TELEPHONE: (903) 255-1000	I.D.# 35-2239600	FACSIMILE: (903) 255-0800

Coordo Inc	Statement Date:	August 5, 2014
Google, Inc.	Statement No.	24555
	Account No.	25019.00004
	Page:	1

RE: Tort Case - Neeley v. Google, et al.

4-11. The second

Services Rendered

						Hours	
	06/03/2014	JRT	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - Correspondence with C. Neeley regarding continued return of certain search results	0.10	37.78
	06/04/2014	JRT	L230	A105	Communicate (in firm) - Correspondence with C. Hawkins (counsel for co-defendant) regarding show cause hearing	0.20	75.56
		JHD L120 A107 Communicate (other outside counsel) - Correspondence w C. Hawkins regarding hearing before Judge Brooks			0.20	132.23	
corre		A104	Review/analyze - Review transcript of the hearing; correspondence with client and M. Page; conference with J. Thane regarding status of proposed order dismissing the				
		107	1440	4400	case	1.20	793.36
		JRT	L110	A108	Communicate (other external) - Correspondence with C. Neeley regarding Google search results	0.10	37.78
		JRT	L440	A106	Communicate (with client) - Correspondence with M. Page	0.40	07.70
			$= \sum_{i=1}^{k} \left\{ a_{i} = 1 \right\}$	y v. C.	and client regarding hearing	0.10	37.78
06/16/2014	JRT	L120 A108	Communicate (other external) - Correspondence with C.				
		JHD	L250	A104	Neeley regarding Google search results Review/analyze - Review Memorandum brief filed by C.	0.10	37.78
		UND	LLOU	///01	Neeley in response to Order to Show Cause	0.20	132.23
	07/18/2014	JRT	L120	A105	Communicate (in firm) - Correspondence with J. Doan		
	07710/2014				regarding case status	0.10	37.78
		JHD	L250	A104	Review/analyze - Review Motion for partial summary judgment of C. Neeley; review memorandum in support;		
	1				conference with J. Thane regarding case status	0.40	264.45
	07/01/2014	J RT	L250	A104	Review/analyze - Analyze motion for summary judgment,		
07/21/2014 J	JKI	L200	A104	supporting brief, and supplement to same	0.50	188.89	
		JHD	L250	A104		0.20	132.23
					supplement; review order regarding filing	0.20	132.23
	07/23/2014	JHD	L250	A104	Review/analyze - Correspondence from C. Neeley regarding God, e-service, and Judge Brooks	0.10	66.11
	07/25/2014	JRT	L250	A104	Review/analyze - Analyze C. Neeley's (plaintiff) motion and supporting brief to dismiss senators and congressmen	0.30	113.33
					n (j. j. seconda) Seconda (j. seconda)		

Googl	ase 5:1 e, linc.	L4-cv-C	5135-7	TLB Document 26-1	Filed 08/19/14	Ad		гауе. 2 108/05/2014 25019-00004 24555
Tort C	ase - Ne	eeley v.	Google,	et al.		Stat	ement NO.	24000
^{ка} н.							Hours	
07/26/2014	JHD	L250	A104	Review/analyze - Review memorandum agreeing t case status			0.20	132.23
07/28/2014	MGT	L120	A105	Communicate (in firm) - (filings and preparing doc		ane regarding	0.10	13.81
08/05/2014	JHD	L250	A104	certain defendants; multi	ple correspondence r	egarding Order	0.10	66.11
	JHD	L250	A104	Review/analyze - Review and sanctions; multiple c defense counsel			0.10	66.11
	JRT	L250	A104	Review/analyze - Analyze	e orders dismissing pa	arties and		
	JRT	L250	A107	sanctioning C. Neeley Communicate (other outs	side counsel) - Multipl	e	0.30	113.33
				correspondence with J. E dismissal orders			0.20	75.56
				Courtesy Discount				-255.44
				For Current Services Rea	ndered		4.80	2,299.00
				Services Rer	ndered Summary			
<u>Timekeeper</u> Jennifer Haltom Doan, Partner Jennifer Haltom Doan, Partner Jennifer Haltom Doan, Partner Michael Thornberry, Paralegal Joshua R. Thane, Associate						<u>Rate</u> \$661.10 661.13 661.15 138.10 377.77 377.78	<u>Total</u> \$198.33 1,057.81 528.92 13.81 226.66 188.89	
Joshua R. Thane, As Joshua R. Thane, As					0.50 0.90	377.80	340.02	
				Adv	vances			
06/03/2014		L190	E116	Trial transcripts - Dana H	layden - Transcript of	hearing		175.20
				Total Advances				175.20
			Cale	Total Current Work				2,474.20
				Previous Balance				\$17,445.13
				Balance Due				\$19,919.33
		Salari Aleren	_		ue Amounts		a water manager of	
		<u>0-3</u> 2,474.2		<u>31-60</u> 61-9 0.007,185.0		<u>121-180</u> 1,093.92	<u>181+</u> 7,261.72	

Case 5:14-cv-05135-TLB Google, Inc.	Document 26-1	Filed 08/19/14	Page 13 of 14 PageID #	#: 315 Page: 3
0003.0,			Account No:	25019-00004
			Statement No:	24555

Tort Case - Neeley v. Google, et al.

s questratid. O projet el

Task Code Services Rendered Summary

		Services Rende	Expenses
L110	Fact Investigation/Development	75.56	0.00
L120	Analysis/Strategy	1014.96	0.00
L190	Other Case Assessment, Development and Administration	0.00	175.20
L100	Case Assessment, Development and Administration	1,090.52	175.20
L230	Court Mandated Conferences	75.56	0.00
L250	Other Written Motions and Submissions	1350.58	0.00
L200	Pre-Trial Pleadings and Motions	1,426.14	0.00
L440	Other Trial Preparation and Support	37.78	0.00
L400	Trial Preparation and Trial	37.78	0.00

1	
4.80	
2,299.00	
175.20	
	4.80 2,299.00

Case 5.14-cv-05135-TLB Document 26-1 Filed 08/19/14 Page 14 of 14 PageID #: 316